
 
 
 

 

        

 
 

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST 
 

Please note the text of this request has been reproduced exactly as received. 
 
 
 
FOI Reference number: FOI 26/2025 
 
 
Date: 16 June 2025 
 
 
Request. 
 
Requesters Comments: On the 10th March 2020 the Northern Ireland Audit Office [NIAO] 
published a report titled “Injury on duty schemes for officers in the Police service of Northern 
Ireland and the Northern Ireland Prison Service”. 
 
Requesters Comments: The purpose of this FOI request is to enquire about the amount of 
influence the NIPB had on the content of the final publication of the above report and in 
particular the Boards input/influence on the final 4 recommendations. 
 
Requesters Comments: The NIPB was one of several stakeholders that contributed to this 
publication. 
 
Could I therefore be provided with the following information.  
 
1. The document confirming the date of first contact with the NIAO re the Police scheme's 
inclusion in the publication. 
 
2. The Date times and minutes of all meetings held with representatives of the NIAO re the 
report 
 
3. The date times and minutes held with all other stakeholders relating to the publication. 
 
4. All documents [to include but not limited to emails] supplied by the NIPB to the NIAO as part 
of the consultation process. 
 
5. All copies of recommendations for the improvement of the Injury on duty scheme as supplied 
to the NIAO by the NIPB. 
 
6. All draft copies of recommendations provided by the NIPB to the NIAO. 
 
7. All draft copies of the Report issued to the NIPB by the NIAO in 2019 for consideration by the 
Board before publication. 
 
8. The NIPB response to 7 above 
 
 

http://www.nipolicingboard.org.uk/index/freedom-of-information/publication-scheme.htm


 
 
 

 

 
Answer:  
 

1. The Board does not hold any recorded information within scope of this request. 
 

2. The Board does not hold any recorded information within scope of this request. 
 

3. Please see attached Minutes dated 6/7 November 2019 and 5 March 2020 policing-
board-minutes-67-november-2019.pdf & Northern Ireland Policing Board 5 March 2020 
Minutes.pdf. 

 
4. The Board does not hold any recorded information within scope of this request. 

 
5. The Board does not hold any recorded information within scope of this request. 

 
6. The Board does not hold any recorded information within scope of this request. 

 
7. The Board does not hold any recorded information within scope of this request. 

 
8. See response to Q7 above.  

 
If you have queries about this request or the decision, please contact the Board quoting the 
reference number above. If you are unhappy with the service you have received and wish to 
make a complaint or request a review you should contact the Board’s Chief Executive -   
 
Via Email: foi@nipolicingboard.org.uk 
 
 
Or in writing at the following address: 
 
Northern Ireland Policing Board 
James House 
Block D 
2 – 4 Cromac Avenue 
The Gasworks 
Belfast 
BT7 2JA 
 
You should contact the Board within 40 working days of this response.  
 

 
If you are not content with the outcome of your complaint, you may apply directly to the 
Information Commissioner.  Generally, the Information Commissioner’s Office cannot 
investigate or make a decision on a case unless you have exhausted the complaints procedure 
provided by the Board.  You should make complaints to the ICO within six weeks of receiving 
the outcome of an internal review. 
 
The Information Commissioner can be contacted at the following web link – 
 
www.ico.org.uk/foicomplaints 
 
or in writing at:  
 

Information Commissioner’s Office 

https://www.nipolicingboard.org.uk/files/nipolicingboard/publications/policing-board-minutes-67-november-2019.pdf
https://www.nipolicingboard.org.uk/files/nipolicingboard/publications/policing-board-minutes-67-november-2019.pdf
https://www.nipolicingboard.org.uk/files/nipolicingboard/publications/Northern%20Ireland%20Policing%20Board%205%20March%202020%20Minutes.pdf
https://www.nipolicingboard.org.uk/files/nipolicingboard/publications/Northern%20Ireland%20Policing%20Board%205%20March%202020%20Minutes.pdf
mailto:foi@nipolicingboard.org.uk
https://newsletter.ico.org.uk/c/11ZwtSQAZVOwtW0cZ0uPgZJZB


 
 
 

 

Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
SK9 5AF 
   

 
 Telephone: - 0303 1231114 
 Email: - ni@ico.org.uk 
 
 
Please be advised that Policing Board replies under Freedom of Information may be released 
into the public domain via our website @ www.nipolicingboard.org.uk. 

Personal details in respect of your request have, where applicable, been removed to protect 
confidentiality. 

mailto:ni@ico.org.uk
http://www.nipolicingboard.org.uk/

