Northern Ireland

PolicingBoard

FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUEST

FOIl Reference number: FOI 14/2013

Date: 22 April 2013

Request:

| want to make a Freedom of Information request, could you please send me the following
information with regards to the organisation’s Mobile Phones:

1.

Existing Supplier(s) - If there is more than one supplier please split the contract up
including the contract value, number of users, duration, contract dates and intemal
contact details.

Answer - Vodaphone

Total contract value- If there isn'’t a total contract value please cans you provide me with
the latest annual spend on mobile phone for each network provider.

Answer — Latest Annual Spend is £2400

Number of Users- Number of connections for each network provider.

Answer— 16

Duration of the contract- please state if the contract also include contract extensions for
each provider.

Answer — 2 years from the order of the phone.



5. Call off Contract/Framework Agreement Start Date- please provide me with information
on when the framework commenced and include the month and year and day if possibie

for each network provider.

Answer — We do not hold this information as it is a National Framework Contract via the
Office of Government Commerce.

6. Call off Contract/Framework Agreement Expiry Date- please provide me with information
on when the framework expires and include the month and year and day if possible for
each network provider.

Answer — We do not hold this information as it is a National Framework Contract via the
Office of Government Commerce.

7. Contract/Framework Agreement Review Date- please provide me with the month and
year and day if possible of when the organisation plans to review it mobile phone
contracts for each network provider.

Answer — We do not hold this information as it is a National Framework Contract via the
Office of Government Commerce.

8. The person within the organisation responsible for this particular contract. Can you send
me the full contact details Contact Name, Job Title, Contact Number and direct email
address for each network provider.

Answer - Neil Lavery, HR &IT MGR, 028 90 40 86 30,
neil.lavery@nipolicingboard.org.uk

If you have queries about this request or the decision please contact the Board quoting the
reference number above. If you are unhappy with the service you have received and wish to
make a complaint or request a review you should write to the Board’s Chief Executive at the
following address:



Northern Ireland Policing Board
Waterside Tower

31 Clarendon Road

Clarendon Dock

Belfast BT1 3BG

Email: foi@nipolicingboard.org.uk

If you are not content with the outcome of your complaint, you may apply directly to the
Information Commissioner. Generally, the Information Commissioner's Office cannot
investigate or make a decision on a case uniess you have exhausted the complaints procedure
provided by the Board. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at:-

The information Commissioner’'s Office — Northern Ireiand
3rd Floor

12 Cromac Place

Gasworks

Ormeau Road

Belfast

BT7 2JB.

Telephone: - 02890 269 380
Email: - ni@ico.gsi.gov.uk
Please be advised that all Policing Board replies under Freedom of Information will be released

into the public domain via our website @ www.nipolicingboard.org.uk.

Personal details in respect of your request have, where applicable, been removed to protect
confidentiality.





